
Welcome to Milledgeville- 

Baldwin County 

The Milledgeville-Baldwin County 
Chamber of Commerce is proud to 
showcase our community, and we’re 
sure you will understand why. While 
Milledgeville is known around the world 
for its historic significance, this college 
town has a vibrant downtown and 
active lake community to boast. Home 
to Georgia College – the public liberal 
arts college of Georgia, Georgia Military 
College and Central Georgia Technical 
College, as well as our public and 
private school systems, education is 
clearly a cornerstone of the economic 
vitality of our community. 

 
Located in the heart of Georgia, 
Milledgeville is more than just a 
regional center of business and 
commerce.  It’s also a great place to 
live, work, play and raise a family.  
Inside this guide, you will find valuable 
tools and the information you need to 
make a new home for yourself or your 
business. From “Capitals, Columns & 
Culture” to “Commerce, Community & 
Collaboration,” we’ve got it all right 
here in Milledgeville-Baldwin County; 
and we are happy to have you as a part 
of our community! 
 

 
April M. Bragg, CEO 
Milledgeville-Baldwin Chamber   

130 S Jefferson Street     

Milledgeville, GA 31061 

478.453.9311 

www.milledgevillega.com

 

The 411 

Emergency Numbers 

 

Emergency     Dial 911 

 

Baldwin County EMS 

Emergencies Only - 911 

Other Calls - 478.454.3790 

 

Law Enforcement 

Milledgeville Police Department 

478.414.4000 

 

Baldwin County Sheriff’s Department 

478.445.4891 

 

Georgia State Patrol 

478.445.4717 

 

Fire 

Milledgeville Fire Department 

478.414.4030 

 

Baldwin County Fire Department  

478.445.4421 

 

Hospital and After Hours Care 

Oconee Regional Medical Center 

821 North Cobb Street 

478.454.3505 

www.oconeeregional.com  

 

Convenient Care MD 

111 Fieldstone Drive 

478.414.1414 

 

Other Emergency Contacts 

Animal Control 

478.445.5514 

Baldwin County Department of 

Family & Children’s Services  

478.445.4135 

 

Oconee Center Crisis Service 

478.445.4357 

 

Poison Control 

1.800.222.1222 

 

Health Department 

953 Barrows Ferry Road 

478.445.4274 

www.northcentralhealthdistrict.com  

 

Government 

City Hall 

119 East Hancock Street 

478.452.2003 

www.milledgevillega.us  

 

Clerk of Courts 

478.445.6324 

 

County Courthouse 

121 North Wilkinson Street 

478.445.4791 

www.baldwincountyga.com  

 

Auto Registration/Tag Renewal 

478.445.4813 

 

Birth or Death Certificate 

Marriage License 

478.445.4807 

 

Business License 

City - 478.414.4006 

County - 478.445.4205 

 

Code Enforcement 

City - 478.414.4021 

County – 478.445.4205 

 

County Extension Agent 

434 North Cobb Street 

478.445.4394 
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Driver’s License 

200 Carl Vinson Road 

478.445.4717 

 

Magistrate Court 

478.445.4446 

 

Public Transportation 

478.445.4521 

 

Recreation Department 

478.445.0785 

www.baldwincountyrec.com 

 

Voter Registration 

478.445.4526 

 

Water & Sewer 

City - 478.414.4404 

County - 478.445.4237 

 

Post Office  

Milledgeville 

118 East Hancock Street  

478.452.4316 

 

Hardwick 

1870 Irwinton Road 

478.454.9119 

 

Library 

Twin Lakes Library System 

Mary Vinson Memorial 

151 South Jefferson Street 

478.452.0677 

www.tllsga.org 

 

Lake Sinclair Library 

3061 North Columbia Street 

478.4532.6522 
 

Ina Dillard Russell Library 

at Georgia College 

478.445.4047 

Sibley-Cone Library 

at Georgia Military College 

478.445.1422 

 

Newspapers 

The Union-Recorder 

(legal organ) 

478.452.0567 

www.unionrecorder.com 

 

The Baldwin Bulletin 

478.452.1777 

www.thebaldwinbulletin.com 

 

Employment 

Georgia Department of Labor 

478.445.5465 

 

Overview, Inc. 

478.453.4111 

 

Rehabilitation Services 

478.445.4781 

 

Middle Georgia Consortium 

478.953.4771 

 

Education 

Baldwin County Board of Education 

110 North ABC Drive 

478.453.4176 

www.baldwin-county-schools.com  

 

Baldwin High School 

155 GA Highway 49 

478.452.6429 

www.baldwinhighschool.net  

 

Oak Hill Middle School 

356 Blandy Road 

478.457.3370 

 

 

Blandy Hills Elementary 

375 Blandy Road 

478.457.2495 

 

Creekside Elementary 

372 Blandy Road 

478.457.3301 

 

Eagle Ridge Elementary 

220 North ABC Drive 

478.457.2967 

 

Early Learning Center 

100 North ABC Drive 

478.457.2461 

 

Central Georgia Technical College 

54 Highway 22 West 

478.445.2300 

www.centralgatech.edu 

 

EBLA Academy 

1943 North Jefferson Street 

478.453.0910 

www.eblaacademy.org 

 

Georgia College 

231 West Hancock Street 

478.445.5004 

www.gcsu.edu 

 

Georgia Military College 

201 East Greene Street 

478.387.4900 

www.gmc.gg.ga.us  

 

Prep School 

478.387.4850 
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John Milledge Academy 

197 Log Cabin Road 

478.452.5570 

www.johnmilledge.org 

 

Elementary School 

478.452.5579 

 

High School 

478.452.7580 

 

Sinclair Christian Academy 

102 Airport Road 

478.453.8400 

www.sinclairconnect.com/sca  

 

Communities in Schools 

521 West Montgomery Street 

478.452.3408 

www.cismilledgeville.org  

 

Utilities 

Cable & Satellite 

Charter Communications 

1.800.955.7766 

www.charter.com  

 

Digicom Services 

1815 Columbia Street 

478.240.0095 

 

DirecTV 

1.888.795.9489 

www.directv.com 

 

Dish Network 

1.877.505.1386 

www.dish.com 

 

Electricity 

Georgia Power Company 

1.888.660.5890 

www.georgiapower.com  

Tri-County Electric  

Membership Corporation  

478.986.8100 

www.tricountyemc.com 

 

Washington EMC 

478.452.1574 

www.washingtonemc.com 

 

Natural Gas 

Atlanta Gas Light Company 

1.800.427.5463 

www.atlantagaslight.com 

 

Georgia Natural Gas 

1.877.850.6200 

www.onlygng.com 

 

SCANA  

1.877.467.2262 

www.scana.com 

 

Telecommunications 

(Phone and Internet) 

Charter Communications 

Residential - 1.800.955.7766 

www.charter.com  

Business - 678-476-5912 

www.chartercom.com 

 

Windstream Communications 

Residential - 1.800.501.1754 

Business – 1.800.501.1776 

Repair - 1.800.782.6206 

www.windstream.com 

 

Waste Management  

Advanced Disposal Services 

131 Britt Waters Road 

478.453.4435 

www.advanceddisposal.com  

 

 

Water  

City - 478.414.4404 

County - 478.445.4237 

 

Community Development 

Organizations 

Milledgeville-Baldwin County  

Chamber of Commerce 

130 South Jefferson Street 

478.453.9311 

www.milledgevillega.com  

 

Milledgeville Convention  

& Visitors Bureau 

200 West Hancock Street 

478.452.4687 

www.visitmilledgeville.org  

 

Milledgeville MainStreet/DDA 

127 East Hancock Street 

478.414.4014 

www.milledgevillemainstreet.com  

 

Development Authority of 

Milledgeville & Baldwin County 

130 South Jefferson Street 

478.451.0369 

www.developmilledgeville.com  

 

Digital Bridges 

127 West Hancock Street 

478.387.0254 

www.thedigitalbridges.org  

www.shoplocalmilledgeville.com 

www.volunteermilledgeville.org 

www.31061.info 
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